Sultrade - Operations Dept

De: Sultrade - Operations Dept

Enviado em: quarta-feira, 29 de outubro de 2025 11:11

Para: umaxops@starbulk.com

Cc: gcl@gcl.gr; operations@sultradeagency.com; M/V Star Cleo
Assunto: RES: MV STAR CLEO / RENEWAL OF SSCEC AT SANTOS

To Starbulk - Greece

Cc Master on MV "STAR CLEO" - At sea
Cc GCL - Greece

Fm Sultrade - Brazil

Dear Ms. Angelika Pitsinou,
Good day!

Message well received and duly noted. We’ll be proceeding accordingly and will pay the
SSCEC tax, in order to apply for the renewal at Santos port.

Based on your below message, unfortunately, at this stage it’s not possible to
guarantee that SSCEC will be renewed by Sanitary Authority at Santos, as it will
depend on the vessel’s prospects and Sanitary Authority availability.

We’1ll keep you duly posted about developments and will be reverting with berthing
prospects as soon as it’s available.

Thank you and best regards.

(Ms) Débora F. Miguel
k Operations Department

Sultrade Shipping Agency
Phone: +55 13 2202 2338
Mobile: + 55 13 996786583

S U LTRADE operations@sultradeagency.com

www.sultradeagency.com

Your Issue,
Our Challenge.

De: umaxops@starbulk.com <umaxops@starbulk.com>

Enviada em: quarta-feira, 29 de outubro de 2025 10:46

Para: Sultrade - Operations Dept <debora.miguel@sultradeagency.com>

Cc: gcl@gcl.gr; operations@sultradeagency.com; M/V Star Cleo <starcleo@gtmailplus.com>
Assunto: Re: RES: MV STAR CLEO / RENEWAL OF SSCEC AT SANTOS

Dear Debora,
Good day.

Your below message is well received. As there is sufficient time before the vsl’s ETA
on 23/11/25, please proceed with the SSCEC renewal. For your reference, the previous
certificate is attached.



Cpt will keep you informed of any updates regarding the vessel’s ETA.

Kindly ensure that the renewal cost is included under DAS, and please keep us informed
of the renewal procedure.

Thank you & Best Regards,

Angelika Pitsinou | Operations Department

E‘l’ll BULK

40 Agiou Konstantinou Str.

Maroussi 151 24, Greece

T: +30 210 6178 400 | D: +30 210 6178 305

M: +30 6940873117

E: apitsinou@starbulk.com E:ops@starbulk.com

From: Sultrade - Operations Dept <debora.miguel@sultradeagency.com>
Sent: 29/10/2025 14:36:23

To: umaxops@starbulk.com <umaxops@starbulk.com>

Cc: gcl@gcl.gr <gcll@gcl.gr>;operations@sultradeagency.com
<operations@sultradeagency.com>

Subject: RES: MV STAR CLEO / RENEWAL OF SSCEC AT SANTOS

To Starbulk - Greece
Cc GCL - Greece
Fm Sultrade - Brazil

Dear Ms. Angelika Pitsinou,
Good day!
We acknowledge safe receipt of your message.

Fyg, we’re experiencing many problems in arranging SSCEC renewals at Santos, as local
Sanitary Authority is implementing a project at the port (which is currently in
force), where all applications must be requested through the system, and at a certain
advance. So, for the SSCEC at Santos, we’d like to draw your attention to the
following:

1. All applications for SSCEC renewal at SANTOS must be done through the PSP system
(Port Paperless System) before vessel’s berthing and a week in advance. So, every
Monday, Sanitary Authority will start their schedule for inspections of the next week;
2. The Agent must insert to the system, the exact day and period (morning or
afternoon) in which the inspection is required/expected to be executed, according to
Sanitary Authority availability and considering only working days (FYG, Sanitary
Authority at Santos does NOT work on Holydays and Weekends). After application being
submitted thru the system, Sanitary Authority will confirm availability (or not) to
attend. Case they have availability for the selected day/period, they will also
confirm it on the system. So, at selected date/period, Sanitary Authority will analyze
the process and will decide whether they will board vessel for physical inspection or
will just remotely analyze documents produced by the vessel;

3. Just for the sake of good order, Sanitary Authority will only analyze the process
on the select date, provided that payment of renewal tax is already affected by the
agent. Case vessel is not berthed at the date/time scheduled, they will simply refuse
to renew the SSCEC;

4. If the vessel berths and departs out of selected date and/or out of Sanitary
Authority working time, it will not be possible to arrange the renewal at Santos.

Based on above, SSCEC will SSCEC renewal will be subjected to Sanitary Authority at
Santos. Furthermore, please note that it will be necessary to pay in advance the SSCEC
tax (once paid, said tax will not be reimbursed), in order to apply for SSCEC renewal
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through the system and select a date/period for the Sanitary Authority to analyze the
process.

It’s important to highlight that each Brazilian port has its own procedures for SSCEC
renewal, meaning that all above instructions/procedures can be changed anytime without
any pre advise. Sultrade is always following up their news to keep you posted
immediately in case of any further changes to the above.

Please find attached involved costs for renewal of SSCEC at Santos. Just for the sake
of good order, in case vessel berths at Left Margin Terminal, boat to access Terminal
will be necessary. Also, in case vessel is expected to berth at TIPLAM Terminal or
USIMINAS Terminal, transportation cost will increase.

We remain at your disposal.

Thank you and best regards.

(Ms) Débora F. Miguel
Operations Department
k Sultrade Shipping Agency
Phone: +55 13 2202 2338
Mobile: + 55 13 996786583
S U LTRmE operations@sultradeagency.com
www.sultradeagency.com

SHIFPING AGEMNCY

De: umaxops@starbulk.com <umaxops@starbulk.com>

Enviada em: quarta-feira, 29 de outubro de 2025 08:04
Para: operations@sultradeagency.com
Assunto: MV STAR CLEO / RENEWAL OF SSCEC AT SANTOS

Dear All,
Good day.

Regarding our vsl Star Cleo, kindly advise if SSCEC renewal is possible at your port,
along with associated cost.

Thank you & Best Regards,

Angelika Pitsinou | Operations Department

PSTAR BULK

40 Agiou Konstantinou Str.

Maroussi 151 24, Greece

T: +30 210 6178 400 | D: +30 210 6178 305

M: +30 6940873117

E: apitsinou@starbulk.com E:ops@starbulk.com




