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Sultrade - Operations Dept

De: Bikos Vassilis <bikos@brave.gr>
Enviado em: quarta-feira, 22 de outubro de 2025 10:44
Para: Sultrade - Operations Dept; Eco Diagon Alley
Cc: Operation Dept (Brave); operations@sultradeagency.com
Assunto: RE: ECO DIAGON ALLEY - ETA SAO FRANCISCO DO SUL O/A 2.11.2025 - AGENT NOMINATION
Anexos: PROFORMA INVOICE - 221020251564.pdf; Agency Appointment - Terms & Conditions.pdf

Hello Felipe, 
I hope you are well. 
 

Thank you for your message and for your discount. 

We confirm your appointment of your good agency for OPA at Santos 
Pls see attached our general Agency Appointment details and provisions.  
 
Pls provide full contact details & PIC handling our vessel. In the meantime note vessel’s contact details asf: 
Capt. Feb Ward Delon H. Empleo 
Master: Eco Diagon Alley 
Grandstream Phone: +30 211 234 9586 
Furono FELCOM-18 3598-0191 
Inmarsat C: 463746463 
e-mail: ecodiagonalley@brave.gr 
 
Master (RIC) @Eco Diagon Alley will keep posted with vsl ETA and all exchanges with Chrts Agents. 
 
Pls note Chrts Agent details as fll: 
LEANDRO AMORIM 
Branch Manager – BRSFS | BRIBB 
operations.sfds@alphamarship.com.br 
Skype: Alphamar – Leandro Amorim 
Office: +55 (47) 3444-1786 
Mobile: +55 (47) 99128-6001 
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Kind Regards, 
 
Cpt. Vassilis Bikos 
Fleet Operator  
 
Brave Maritime Corporation Inc. 
331 Kifissias ave.,145 61 ,Kifissia ,Greece 
Mob: +30 695 933 4750 
Tel: +30 210 625 2849 (ext 265) 
Email: bikos@brave.gr 
Group: operation@brave.gr 
 
 

From: Sultrade - Operations Dept <felipe.ferreira@sultradeagency.com>  
Sent: 22 October 2025 16:39 
To: Bikos Vassilis <bikos@brave.gr> 
Cc: Operation Dept (Brave) <Operation@brave.gr>; operations@sultradeagency.com 
Subject: RES: ECO DIAGGON ALLEY - ETA SAO FRANCISCO DO SUL O/A 2.11.2025 - AGENT QUERY 
 

 
TO: BRAVE MARITIME CORPORATION INC. 
CC: GCL MARINE SOLUTIONS 
FM: SULTRADE SHIPPING AGENCY 
 
Dear Cpt. Vassilis Bikos, 
Good day. 
 
Please find in attached the PDA with the estimated cost requested for SFS Port. 
 
Kindly note the vessel’s prospects as per charterer’s agent information: 
 
BERTHING PROSPECTS: 
TERMINAL          : COMM QUAY – BERTH 1 
OPS/CARGO         : LOAD/SBS 69.150 MT 
ETA               : NOV/05TH, AGW WP  
ETB               : NOV/05TH, AGW WP 
ETC/S             : NOV/07TH, AGW WP 
 

  Caution: This is an external email Please take care when clicking links or opening attachments. When in doubt, ALWAYS contact our IT Department   
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Please do not hesitate in contacting this office, case you require any further information and/or clarification. 
 
We remain at your disposal. 
 
Best regards, 

 

Felipe Ferreira 
Operations Department 
Sultrade Shipping Agency 
Phone: +55 53 3235.3500 
Mobile: +55 53 999063512 

 
operations@sultradeagency.com 
www.sultradeagency.com 

 

 

De: Bikos Vassilis <bikos@brave.gr>  
Enviada em: quarta-feira, 22 de outubro de 2025 06:39 
Cc: Operation Dept (Brave) <Operation@brave.gr> 
Assunto: ECO DIAGGON ALLEY - ETA SAO FRANCISCO DO SUL O/A 2.11.2025 - AGENT QUERY 
 
Dear Agents at Sao Francisco Do Sul, gd day, 
  
Kindly be advised that the subject Kamsarmax vessel under our Management will call at Santos or Sao Francisco do Sul to load her cargo soya beans (tbc)  in bulk on her T-
Chrs. 
Tentative ETA o/a 2/11 agw wp. All port/cargo formalities will be handled by chrs agents (we do not yet know their firm). 
  
On the owners' side, we are looking for Full Protective Agency to include the below: 

1. Crew Changes 6 on / 6 off (all Filipino). Include expenses for transportation from Airport to vessel and vice versa, visa/immigration formality fees, hotel 
accommodation for one night, etc.  
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2. Launch service cost, if any 
3. Hotel costs 
4. Travelling expenses 
5. Garbage disposal costs 
6. The attendance to include daily prospects, loading. updates/progress, preparing the vessel for her call and for potential PSC inspection, boarding on arrival / 

departure, and daily visits (if necessary), attendance/assistance during PSC and other inspections, and assisting for holds inspections. 
7. Your Agency/handling fees for the above services 

 
We would appreciate receiving your most competitive proforma D/A for owners/husbandry agencies for this forthcoming call at Santos for the above items. 
 
Pls provide your PDA in proper PDF or Excel format for easy ref/comparison. 
  
As soon as we receive your quotation, we will evaluate it and reply with comments and/or an official appointment. 
  
Thanks and regards. 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Cpt. Vassilis Bikos 
Fleet Operator  
 
Brave Maritime Corporation Inc. 
331 Kifissias ave.,145 61 ,Kifissia ,Greece 
Mob: +30 695 933 4750 
Tel: +30 210 625 2849 (ext 265) 
Email: bikos@brave.gr 
Group: operation@brave.gr 
 
 


