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Sultrade - Operations Dept.

De: Sultrade - Operations Dept <operations@sultradeagency.com>
Enviado em: segunda-feira, 3 de julho de 2023 15:40
Para: 'Sultrade - Accounts Dept'; 'Sultrade - Marcone Pacheco'
Cc: SULTRADE OPERATIONS
Assunto: ENC: AOM GAIA - Official appointment for Husbandry agency / Iblea - July 03

Prioridade: Alta

At Marcone, 
 
Segue abaixo o apontamento oficial do MV AOM GAIA em Santos. 
 
Este navio está sendo apontado apenas como HUSBANDRY assim sendo não podemos cobrar AGENCY-FEE nessa 
escala, a menos que eles modifiquem o apontamento. Conversei hoje com o Capt Albertos da IBLEA, e ele informou 
que se for possível vai alterar o apontamento para ProtecƟng Agents, mas de momento, não. 
 
Abaixo estão as instruções de faturamento, assim sendo não é necessário pedir depois. 
 
Obrigado 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
Our domain has been changed to @sultradeagency.com. Please update your e-mailing list. 
 
operations@sultradeagency.com 
Sultrade – Operations Dept. 
accounts@sultradeagency.com 
Sultrade – Accounts Dept.  
ceo@sultradeagency.com 
Sultrade – Board of Directors 

 

Flavio Velloso 

Operations Manager 

Sultrade Shipping Agency 
Phone:       +55 53 3235.3500 
Mobile:      +55 53 999.961.602 
WhatsApp: +55 53 999.711.280 
operations@sultradeagency.com 
www.sultradeagency.com  

 
 

De: operations <operations@ibleasm.com>  
Enviada em: segunda-feira, 3 de julho de 2023 11:36 
Para: operations@sultradeagency.com 
Cc: GCL GCL <gcl@gcl.gr>; GCL Evi Rozaki <evi.rozaki@gcl.gr>; purchasing <purchasing@ibleasm.com>; Christos 
Grammenos <cgrammenos@ibleasm.com>; Thomas Tampathanis <ttampathanis@ibleasm.com>; Emiliano Altube - 
Iblea <ealtube@ibleasm.com>; safety <safety@ibleasm.com> 
Assunto: AOM GAIA - Official appointment for Husbandry agency / Iblea - July 03 
Prioridade: Alta 
 
Dear Sultrade team, good day and happy Monday. 
 
This is our official appointment as HUSBANDRY agents for our lady’s AOM GAIA forthcoming call to Santos.  
 



2

The vessel is giving ETA 18th July and the Master (ric) will keep you posted with his ETA respecƟvely.  
 
The charterers agents are messers Alphamar.  
 
Our various departments (ric) will revert with inquiries in due Ɵme. 
 
-FDA covering husbandry exps to be addressed to: 
Mv AOM GAIA 
c/o Iblea Ship Management Ltd 
Vault 5-6 Upper Floor, Pinto Wharf 
Floriana FRN1913, Malta 
E/invoice to: mailto:recepƟon.malta@augustea.com ( cc our office operaƟons@ibleasm.com ) 
 
 
We would appreciate receiving your acknowledgement/confirmaƟon 
 
Thank you and best regards 
 
 
Evangelos Albertos 
Operations Department 
  

 
  
40, Agiou Konstantinou Street, Maroussi, Athens 
  
Mobile : +39 349 1518270 
?Email: ealbertos@ibleasm.com 
  
  

 
Save Paper! Think before you print 
 
The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in the message only. It is strictly 
forbidden to share any part of this message with a third party without a written consent of the sender. If you 
received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure 
such a mistake does not occur again.  

This email (and any attachments to it) may be confidential and may also be legally privileged. It is intended solely for 
the stated addressee(s) and access to it by any other person is unauthorised. If you are not an addressee, you must 
not disclose, 
copy, circulate or in any other way use or rely on the information contained in this email. If you have received it 
in error, please inform us immediately and delete all copies. 

Copyright reserved.  

Any views or opinions expressed are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the 
company. You should check this e-mail and any attachments to it for the presence of viruses and no liability is 
accepted for any damage caused, directly or indirectly, by any virus transmitted. 
--  
This message has been checked by ESG and is believed to be clean. 


